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Scott M. Price is a partner in Withum’s Baltimore and Bethesda, 
Maryland offices, where his primary area of concentration is audits of 
employee benefit plans and labor organizations. He has years of 
hands-on experience in overseeing some of the firm’s largest audits 
for both local and international labor organizations and their related 
employee benefit plans. Scott has developed expertise in all aspects 
of federal reporting and compliance for employee benefit plans and 
labor unions and in auditing and consulting for defined benefit and 
defined contribution pension and health and welfare plans. He has 
supervised and performed audit fieldwork for international, national 
and local unions and Taft-Hartley employee benefit funds. Scott’s 
broad experience encompasses agreed-upon procedures such as a 
variety of payroll audits, fraud audits, internal controls consulting, 
claims audits and management consulting. He is also proficient in 
preparing Forms 990, 990-T, 5500 and LM-2. Scott is also a member of 
the International Foundation Professionals Committee. He is a mem-
ber of the American Institute of Certified Public Accountants and the 
Maryland Association of Certified Public Accountants. Scott holds a 
bachelor of science degree in accounting from the University of 
Maryland where he currently serves as an advisory director. He is a 
certified public accountant in Maryland and New Jersey.


